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TechnoVision
2023

FLUID WORKFORCE

An agile, adaptive workforce model 
that boosts organizational resilience 
and productivity, saves costs and 
addresses the shortages of skilled 
resources.
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THE TEAM 
IS THE CANVAS
Collaborating in hybrid 
teams-oriented workspaces becomes 
the new natural place for creating 
next-level business results.
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TAKEN BY TOKENS

Emergence of a ‘Token Economy’ 
through the convergence of ‘real’ 
and digital assets within real and 
digital business models – converging 
on themselves.
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Enabled by efficient ‘mesh’ 
technology, it’s easier than ever for 
organizations to join forces, even if it 
is lightweight, just for one day, for 
one occasion, or for one customer.

YOUR MESH
FOR LESS
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Leveraging autonomous, 
decentralized, token-enabled 
platforms to achieve joint objectives 
– but without the typical red tape of 
corporate leadership.

NO LEADERS


